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Very helpful. 
 
Many thanks!
 
 

 

From:  
Sent: Thursday, March 01, 2018 11:12 AM
To: 
Subject: RE: question on funding
 
Hi ,
 
The activity referred to in the press release is a running project the Netherlands Embassy in
Amman has with UNRWA under the “reception in the region” fund (the 260 million fund for Iraq,
Jordan, Lebanon and Turkey). The project was initially signed for the period Nov 2016-Nov 2017
but has been extended under a non-cost extension until the end of March 2018. The Embassy is
looking into a new (possibly similar) bilateral project with UNRWA now, but whether there would
be funding for that is not clear yet.
 
As to core funding, we already paid the annual contribution of 13m euro. I don’t think there’s
been any talk about additional core funding to UNRWA so far.
 
Regards,
 

 

From:  
Sent: Thursday, March 1, 2018 8:18 AM
To: 
Subject: question on funding
 
Morning 
 
Keifak?  Long time no see..
Can you please tell me if the below announcement is new funding?
Can you also specify Dutch contributions to UNRWA so far and if more is expected?
 
Many thanks for your kind help.
 
Best,
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https://www.unrwa.org/newsroom/press-releases/netherlands-supports-education-palestine-
refugee-children-syria-jordan
 
 
 

 

Help save paper! Do you really need to print this email?

Dit bericht kan informatie bevatten die niet voor u is bestemd. Indien u niet de
geadresseerde bent of dit bericht abusievelijk aan u is toegezonden, wordt u verzocht dat
aan de afzender te melden en het bericht te verwijderen. De Staat aanvaardt geen
aansprakelijkheid voor schade, van welke aard ook, die verband houdt met risico's
verbonden aan het elektronisch verzenden van berichten.

This message may contain information that is not intended for you. If you are not the
addressee or if this message was sent to you by mistake, you are requested to inform the
sender and delete the message. The State accepts no liability for damage of any kind
resulting from the risks inherent in the electronic transmission of messages.
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